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7 22.12.2015 In terms of communication, the EOS 5D Mark II comes
with the latest White balance and Movie Mode, while the Mark III can
shoot in RAW format, it does not feature a " In terms of communication,
the EOS 5D Mark II comes with the latest White balance and Movie
Mode, while the Mark III can shoot in RAW format, it does not feature a
"Magic Lantern" Movie mode, which gives the manual control of the
focus and shutter speed. the Mark III features the slow motion video
recording mode, and they are: 7. A movie mode which can be set to
automatic or manual control the focus and the shutter speed and a
White balance auto selection. 2. The image stabilization system is ideal
for moving subjects. a viewfinder with a touch screen, gives a user the
possibility to operate the shooting with the touch screen or with the
viewfinder. 4. The possibility to create your own Creative filters. With
such a wide range of choices as Canon offers, the camera can be
customized according to the needs of the photographer or videographer
and can be adapted to a particular project. A wide range of accessories
have been developed to meet the needs of different levels of
photographers. an HDMI terminal, with an interface for connecting a
TV set or an LCD monitor, and a charging and USB interface for laptop
computers. 6. The Wi-Fi system allows the user to remotely control the
camera through the Internet. This feature is ideal for controlling the
camera and remotely launching it. It is also possible to transfer images
to a smartphone or tablet through a Wi-Fi network. The range of power
and the number of images are regulated by the activation of the Wi-Fi
function. a HD Movie recording system, more efficient than the
traditional method of recording onto a memory card, in which the
camera records the image and the sound at the same time. a choice of
three fixed focal lengths of 18, 24 or 35mm. One of the most innovative
features of the EOS-M series is the internal stereo microphone, which
allows the user to talk directly into the camera. and because it is
possible to install video connectors in order to connect a smartphone,
tablet or other device to the internal lithium battery. EOS M3 of the



Mark III Not only the design, but also the construction of the EOS M3,
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